2021 FLEET VEHICLES

Public Service Department

| ﬁ;
WESTERVILLI
Quote Summary

SPECIFICATION #5 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Ir}ferceptor UNIT PRICE 2016 Ford UPI|  WITRADE-IN Push Bumper Cz:«;i/sPos’:tei;ion 's’::;rée;r;;a;::’:; V6 Gasoline Engine
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($7,000.00) $32,199.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($8,750.00) $31,346.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($8,500.00) $30,795.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($5,000.00) $34,411.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #10 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Interceptor UNIT PRICE NIA P'::ICTERADE-IN Push Bumper N Pri/ior:i;_ I;ris;réer Tra;spz_m V6 Gasoline Engine
Crossover Utility age/Partition eat/Cargo Barrier
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 N/A $39,199.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 N/A $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 N/A $40,096.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford Late Submission (1) Late Submission (1)
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 N/A $39,411.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 N/A $40,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #11 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Interceptor | | UNITPRICE 1,310 oy ypy| wITRADEN PUSREUTRET | ogerparion | SeayGargo Bamer | e
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($5,700.00) $33,499.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($6,850.00) $33,246.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($7,000.00) $32,295.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($4,500.00) $34,911.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #14 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Interceptor || UNITPRICE 1,0 0o 4\ | wTRADEAN PUSMEUTRET | ogelpariion | SeaGargo Bamer | o
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($5,500.00) $33,699.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($6,850.00) $33,246.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($6,800.00) $32,495.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($3,000.00) $36,411.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #17 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Polics Interceptor || UNITPRICE |16 oy ypy | wiTRADEIN PUSMEUTRET | Gogalparition | SeayGargo Barer | o
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($6,900.00) $32,299.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($7,850.00) $32,246.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($7,500.00) $31,795.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($5,500.00) $33,911.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #20 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Interceptor | [ UNITPRICE [0 L PRORE | |1 s sumper | aner | rieonr Tranaport | 6 ool Enine
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($7,900.00) $31,299.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($9,250.00) $30,846.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($9,000.00) $30,295.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($5,800.00) $33,611.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00
SPECIFICATION #22 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Hybrid AWD Police Interceptor | [ UNITPRICE [0 © L PRORE e | |1 P sumper | eaner | rieonr Tranaport | 6 Gl Enine
Crossover Utility
Advantage Ford $39,199.00 ($7,700.00) $31,499.00 $639.00 $1,368.00 $1,549.00 $743.00
Cooper Ford $39,717.00 | No Trade Offer $39,717.00 $496.30 $1,678.38 $258.30 -$257.00
Krieger Ford $40,096.00 ($10,500.00) $29,596.00 $336.75 $215.20 $1,610.25 $743.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $39,295.00 ($8,800.00) $30,495.00 $411.00 $868.00 $1,080.00 $600.00
Montrose Ford $39,411.36 ($5,700.00) $33,711.36 $453.00 $881.00 $1,166.00 $705.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $40,077.60 ($1,000.00) $39,077.60 $437.00 $1,020.00 $1,535.00 $790.00

BltiLJ;@lL(b.Alti
$35,755.00
$42,149.98
$33,508.20
$33,154.00
$36,911.36
$42,069.60

Total with Alts
1-3
$42,755.00
$42,149.98

$42,258.20

$41,911.36
$43,069.60

1-3
$37,055.00
$42,149.98
$35,408.20
$34,654.00
$37,411.36
$42,069.60

Total with Alts
1-3

$37,255.00
$42,149.98
$35,408.20
$34,854.00
$38,911.36
$42,069.60

Total with Alts
1-3

$35,855.00
$42,149.98
$34,408.20
$34,154.00
$36,411.36
$42,069.60

Total with Alts
1-3

$34,855.00
$42,149.98
$33,008.20
$32,654.00
$36,111.36
$42,069.60

Total with Alts

$35,055.00
$42,149.98
$31,758.20
$32,854.00
$36,211.36
$42,069.60




SPECIFICATION #280 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
42 Truck Chassis withRoguar || UNITPRICE. | 2012 Ford | "LTaDE || o |0 o oo st o | s ovgur | s | comnt, | i e
Cab & Forestry Body F550 Medical Kit Extended Cab
Montrose Ford $85,151.60 ($17,000.00) $68,151.60 Included $1,050.00 Included Included Included $5,100.00 $2,136.00 Included
Valley Ford - Option 1 (2) $90,972.00 ($13,000.00) $77,972.00 Included $450.00 Included Included Included $3,975.00 $3,200.00 $17,752.00
Valley Ford - Option 2 (3) $73,477.00 ($13,000.00) $60,477.00 N/A $450.00 $138.00 $465.00 $145.00 $3,975.00 $3,200.00 $17,752.00
Yark Chevrolet $94,494.00 ($21,500.00) $72,994.00 Included N/A Included Included Included N/A N/A Included
S_PECIFICATI(?N #281 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE
ke with Roguar Gy || | |2011 Ford 150 WTRADE-N
Cooper Ford $30,993.00 | No Trade Offer $30,993.00
Krieger Ford $32,348.00 ($9,000.00) $23,348.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $32,400.00 ($8,500.00) $23,900.00
Montrose Ford $33,073.55 ($4,000.00) $29,073.55
Walt Sweeney Ford Trade Only ($7,000.00) Trade Only
Yark Chevrolet $31,408.00 ($5,200.00) $26,208.00
SPECIFICATION #416 UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE A:'III'EZyNaA":E AI;I;E:[:QIE ::':ﬁ:::‘:’f
Cargo Van N/A WI/TRADE-IN cn:f:;::st Hitch %
Advantage Ford $31,924.00 N/A $31,924.00 $500.00 $1,875.00 Included $34,299.00
Krieger Ford $33,450.00 N/A $33,450.00 $485.00 $1,085.00 Included $35,020.00
Larkin Greenewood Ford $31,259.00 N/A $31,259.00 $695.00 $1,099.00 $499.00 $33,552.00
Montrose Ford $32,238.25 N/A $32,238.25 $430.00 $2,750.00 Included $35,418.25
Walt Sweeney Ford $35,475.00 N/A $35,475.00 $299.00 No Bid N/A $35,774.00
Watsonville Fleet Group $35,522.46 N/A $35,522.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35,522.46
Yark Chevrolet (5) $26,693.00 N/A $26,693.00 $275.00 $834.00 $595.00 $28,397.00
SPECIFICATION #705 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
4x4 Pickup with Regular Cab and UNIT PRICE 2012 Ford P'::?I'ERADE-IN Sign Post Driver Sign Post Puller Hydraulic Saw . J:::L gi/:y\;u.
Utility Body F250 i Total with Alt. 4
Montrose Ford $56,937.92 ($6,500.00) $50,437.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50,437.92
Walt Sweeney Ford Trade Only ($11,500.00) Trade Only No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Trade Only
Yark Chevrolet $51,645.00 ($15,000.00) $36,645.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 $36,845.00
SPECIFICATION #717 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
4X4 Pickup with Regular Cab and || UNIT PRICE | 2009 Ford | i RADEN ediiner | 9800w Power | Tommy Gate [ stal Gl | 1 s
Utility Body Ranger - 1.2and4
Larkin Greenewood Ford $40,099.00 ($3,500.00) $36,599.00 $595.00 $4,895.00 $3,695.00 $200.00 $42,289.00
Montrose Ford $44,743.53 ($4,000.00) $40,743.53 $595.00 $5,100.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $46,438.53
Walt Sweeney Ford Trade Only ($5,500.00) Trade Only No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Trade Only
Yark Chevrolet $43,371.00 ($3,000.00) $40,371.00 $495.00 $1,183.00 (6) $3,410.00 $200.00 $42,090.75
.SPECIF.ICATION #791 TRADE-IN PRICE PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
4x4 Pickup l\jltlit“!;yR;g’:;ar Cab and UNIT PRICE 201 F12§8rd WITRADE-IN Snovpfﬂi::l::/g :rep Snow Plow ful::lsi;;"e ;::y‘;L LLnu
Larkin Greenewood Ford $49,534.00 ($12,600.00) $36,934.00 $275.00 $6,995.00 $200.00 $37,409.00
Montrose Ford $49,771.64 ($6,500.00) $43,271.64 $250.00 $7,500.00 No Bid $43,521.64
Yark Chevrolet $48,627.00 ($15,000.00) $33,627.00 $275.00 $4,895.00 (6) $200.00 $34,102.00
SPECIFICATION #797 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE | ALTERNATE
Full Size Pickup - 3/4tn - 2wd - || UNIT PRICE | 2008 Ford | o ADEAN edtiner | insai ity
SRW - Regular Cab Ranger i Total with Alt. 1
Cooper Ford Withdrawal of Quote (7) Withdrawal of Quote (7)
Larkin Greenewood Ford $32,524.00 ($3,500.00) $29,024.00 $595.00 $200.00 $29,819.00
Montrose Ford $30,236.92 ($3,500.00) $26,736.92 $595.00 No Bid $27,331.92
Walt Sweeney Ford Trade Only ($4,400.00) Trade Only No Bid No Bid Trade Only
Yark Chevrolet $34,102.00 ($3,700.00) $30,402.00 $525.00 $200.00 $31,127.00

Notes

Alts.
$76,437.60
$103,349.00
$86,602.00
$72,994.00 (@)

(1) Larkin Greenewood Ford submitted a late response for Cruiser #10, in the amount of $41,654 for the vehicle with accepted alternates. As accepting a late response could be interpreted as offering a competitive advantage and
undermining the public procurement values of impartiality/integrity and trust, staff recommends the Cruiser #10 quote from Larkin Greenewood Ford be treated as non-responsive to the requirements of the City's Fleet RFQ.
(2) Reflects Valley Ford's pricing for furnishing a vehicle meeting the specifications detailed in the City's Fleet RFQ.
(3) Reflects alternative pricing volunteered by Valley Ford for a truck with forestry body that differs from the specifications detailed in the City's Fleet RFQ.
(4) Yark Chevrolet did not provide pricing for the spotlight, power inverter and extended cab alternates; such items are not reflected in the total figure.

(5) The cargo van quoted by Yark Chevrolet does not meet the requirements specified in the City's Fleet RFQ.

(6) The identified alternate equipment does not meet the requirements specified in the City's Fleet RFQ.
(7) Cooper Ford submitted a quote for Truck #797 then subsequently asked to withdraw the quote as they learned from the manufacturer that they were no longer able to place an order for the quoted vehicle.



