2012 FLEET VEHICLES
Public Service Department
Wednesday, March 7, 2012

CITY OF WESTERVILLE
21S. STATE STREET
WESTERVILLE, OH 43081

3:00 PM
Bid Summary
SPECIFICATION #9 UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE EIDSETLIrIVl\ELE\(D ALTERNATE 9-A ESTIMATED DELIVERY ALTERNATE 9-B ESTIMATED DELIVERY
Full Size 4-Door Car (ITEM A) W/TRADE-IN IN DAYS Alternate Fuel IN DAYS Hybrid Vehicle INDAYS
Advantage Ford No Bid
Byers Chevrolet No Bid
Byers Dodge $23,659.00 $6,500.00 $17,159.00 90-120 No Bid No Bid
Jack Maxtown Chevrolet $26,600.00 $5,000.00 $21,600.00 180 No Bid No Bid
Ricart Properties No Bid
Valley Ford Truck No Bid
(State) Greve Chrysler Dodge $22,949.00 $2,500.00 $20,449.00 State of Ohio Contract Comparison
SPECIFICATION #302 ONIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE Esgll_r;llv»g;E\(D OAI;.'I'ERleATE 3&2-1 ALTERNATE 302-2 ALTERNATE 302-3 ALTERNATE 302-A ESTIMATED DELIVERY ALTERNATE 302-B
i i W/TRADE-IN ptional Snow Flow i i IN DAYS i i
4 X 4 Pickup with Regular Cab (ITEM B) IN DAYS Prep Package Optional Snow Plow Optional Tool Box Alternate Fuel Hybrid Vehicle
Advantage Ford $24,798.00 $1,700.00 $23,098.00 60 $83.00 $4,885.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid
Byers Chevrolet $24,896.00 $3,500.00 $21,396.00 60-90 $251.00 $4,885.00 $665.00 No Bid No Bid
Byers Dodge No Bid
Jack Maxtown Chevrolet $25,100.00 $4,000.00 $21,100.00 56-86 $0.00 [Tnoluded $4,285.00 $665.00 No Bid No Bid
Ricart Properties $24,800.00 $2,000.00 $22,800.00 80-100 $0.00 [included $4,885.00 $760.00 $0.00[E85/FFV Included J80-100 No Bid
Valley Ford Truck $26,558.04 $2,500.00 $24,058.04 90-120 $85.00 | $4,824.00 $785.00 $14,987.00add for Propane Conversion I No Bid
|(state) Germain Ford $24,154.00 $4,00000 | $20,154.00 Egszrry | i $0.00 $4,885.00 $760.00 State of Ohio Contract Comparison
SPECIFICATION #412 UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE EDSETI'_';"VAELEYD ALTERNATE412:A | cori\MATED DELIVERY ALTERNATE 4128 | £ o1\MATED DELIVERY
Compact 7-Passenger Van (ITEM C) W/TRADE-IN IN DAYS Alternate Fuel IN DAYS Hybrid Vehicle IN DAYS
Advantage Ford No Bid
Byers Chevrolet No Bid
Byers Dodge $21,395.00 $1,000.00 $20,395.00 60-90 No Bid No Bid
Jack Maxtown Chevrolet $27,604.00 $3,000.00 $24,604.00 56-86 No Bid No Bid
Ricart Properties No Bid
Valley Ford Truck No Bid
(State) Charlie's Dodge No Bid State of Ohio Contract Comparison
SPECIFICATION #415 ONIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE ESELTV,ZL%{D ALTERNATE 415-A ESTIMATED DELIVERY ALTERNATE 415-B ESTIMATED DELIVERY
Compact 7-Passenger Van (ITEM D) w/TRADE-IN IN DAYS Alternate Fuel IN DAYS Hybrid Vehicle IN DAYS
Advantage Ford No Bid
Byers Chevrolet No Bid
Byers Dodge $21,395.00 $2,250.00 $19,145.00 60-90 No Bid No Bid
Jack Maxtown Chevrolet $27,604.00 $2,000.00 $25,604.00 56-86 No Bid No Bid
Ricart Properties No Bid
Valley Ford Truck No Bid
(State) Charlie's Dodge No Bid State of Ohio Contract Comparison
SPECIFICATION #503 UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE EIDSETLIrIVl\ELE\(D OAI;TERII\ISATE 5;3-1 ALTERNATE 503-2 ALTERNATE 503-3 ALTERNATE 503-A ESTIMATED DELIVERY ALTERNATE 503-B
4X 4 Pickup with Regular Cab (ITEME) WITRADE-IN INDAYS prional Snow POW | optional Snow Plow | Optional Tool Box Alternate Fuel IN DAYS Hybrid Vehicle
Prep Package
Advantage Ford $24,798.00 $2,000.00 $22,798.00 60 $83.00 $4,885.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid
Byers Chevrolet $24,896.00 $7,250.00 $17,646.00 60-90 $251.00 $4,885.00 $665.00 No Bid No Bid
Byers Dodge No Bid
Jack Maxtown Chevrolet $25,100.00 $7,000.00 $18,100.00 56-86 $0.00 Ncided $4,285.00 $665.00 No Bid No Bid
nclude
Ricart Properties $24,800.00 $7,000.00 $17,800.00 80-100 $0.00 | $4,885.00 $760.00 $0.00'— 80-100 No Bid
P Included E85/FFV
Valley Ford Truck $26,558.04 $3,500.00 $23,058.04 90-120 $85.00 $4,824.00 $785.00 $14,987. ; No Bid
{Add for Propane Conversion |
(State) Germain Ford $24,154.00 $6,000.00 $18,154.00 ‘ | $0.00 $4,885.00 $760.00 State of Ohio Contract Comparison

1Included



ESTIMATED DELIVERY
IN DAYS

]

ESTIMATED DELIVERY
IN DAYS

$28,546.00
$23,447.00
$23,050.00
$23,445.00
$28,752.04

$23,799.00




