2018 FLEET VEHICLES

Public Service Department

WESTERVILLE
Quote Summary

SPECIFICATION #10 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
AWD Police Interceptor UNIT PRICE NET PRICE Push Bumper Prisoner Cage Partition Prisoner Transport Seat
Crossover UtiIity W/TRADE-'N and Window Bars with Cargo Barrier
Budget: $32,000 Total
Lebanon Ford (State Coop.) $29,799.00 ($6,600.00) $23,199.00 $595.00 $1,095.00 $1,495.00 $26,384.00
Statewide Ford (Columbus Coop.) $29,692.00 ($4,000.00) $25,692.00 $400.00 $1,191.00 $1,359.00 $28,642.00
Valley Ford Truck No Bid ($5,000.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
\
SPECIFICATION #15 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
AWD Police Interceptor UNIT PRICE NET PRICE Push Bumper Prisoner Cage Partition Prisoner Transport Seat
Crossover UtiIity W/TRADE-'N and Window Bars with Cargo Barrier
Budget: $32,000 Total
Lebanon Ford (State Coop.) $29,799.00 ($6,200.00) $23,599.00 $595.00 $1,095.00 $1,495.00 $26,784.00
Statewide Ford (Columbus Coop.) $29,692.00 ($4,000.00) $25,692.00 $400.00 $1,191.00 $1,359.00 $28,642.00
Valley Ford Truck No Bid ($3,500.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SPECIFICATION #19 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
AWD Police Interceptor UNIT PRICE NET PRICE Push Bumper Prisoner Cage Partition Prisoner Transport Seat
Crossover Ut"iw W/TRADE'IN and Window Bars with Cargo Barrier
Budget: $32,000 Total
Lebanon Ford (State Coop.) $29,799.00 ($6,600.00) $23,199.00 $595.00 $1,095.00 $1,495.00 $26,384.00
Statewide Ford (Columbus Coop.) $29,692.00 ($4,000.00) $25,692.00 $400.00 $1,191.00 $1,359.00 $28,642.00
Valley Ford Truck No Bid ($5,000.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SPECIFICATION #407 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
Medium Size
4-Door Hybrid Car UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $25,000 Total
Middletown Ford $26,296.00 ($1,500.00) $24,796.00 $24,796.00
Ricart Ford $24,316.00 ($1,000.00) $23,316.00 $23,316.00
Walt Sweeney Ford (State Coop.) $23,956.00 ($3,000.00) $20,956.00 $20,956.00
SPECIFICATION #408 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
Medium Size
4-Door Hybrid Car UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $25,000 Total
Middletown Ford $26,296.00 ($1,000.00) $25,296.00 $25,296.00
Ricart Ford $24,316.00 ($300.00) $24,016.00 $24,016.00
Walt Sweeney Ford (State Coop.) $23,956.00 ($2,400.00) $21,556.00 $21,556.00
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SPES:I;IiSI:L_\JpI?rNUiSW UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE ALI;EFPTCTE AL'I;IEOIIR::;ATE A;'!;E::\IL,:IE
Regular Cab w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $35,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $34,257.87 ($3,500.00) $30,757.87 $3,255.00 $740.00 $420.00 $35,172.87
Middletown Ford $31,697.00 ($3,500.00) $28,197.00 $4,000.00 $750.00 $550.00 $33,497.00
Ricart Ford $30,182.00 ($4,000.00) $26,182.00 $5,695.00 $840.00 $450.00 $33,167.00
Valley Ford Truck $31,626.84 ($7,500.00) $24,126.84 $3,997.00 $1,011.00 $496.00 $29,630.84
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $31,814.73 ($6,500.00) $25,314.73 $3,100.00 $711.00 $463.50 $29,589.23
Walt Sweeney Ford $30,616.00 ($6,000.00) $24,616.00 $3,255.00 $746.00 $420.00 $29,037.00
SPESZII;IiSI:AJ;?rNuc#f(7O3 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
Regul-ar Cab UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $25,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $27,099.68 ($800.00) $26,299.68 $26,299.68
Middletown Ford $29,219.00 ($750.00) $28,469.00 $28,469.00
Ricart Ford $28,369.00 ($300.00) $28,069.00 $28,069.00
Valley Ford Truck $29,122.92 ($700.00) $28,422.92 $28,422.92
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $24,294.50 ($600.00) $23,694.50 $23,694.50 (incomplete bid)
Walt Sweeney Ford $26,511.00 ($800.00) $25,711.00 $25,711.00
SPES:I;IiSI:L_\JpI?rNUCTOQ UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE ALI;EFPTCTE AL'I;IEOIIR::;ATE A;'!;E::\IL,:IE
Regular Cab w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $35,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $34,257.87 ($5,000.00) $29,257.87 $3,255.00 $740.00 $420.00 $33,672.87
Middletown Ford $31,478.00 ($5,500.00) $25,978.00 $4,000.00 $800.00 $600.00 $31,378.00
Ricart Ford $30,182.00 ($5,200.00) $24,982.00 $5,695.00 $840.00 $450.00 $31,967.00
Valley Ford Truck $31,626.84 ($7,500.00) $24,126.84 $3,997.00 $1,011.00 $496.00 $29,630.84
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $31,814.73 ($9,500.00) $22,314.73 $3,100.00 $711.00 $463.50 $26,589.23
Walt Sweeney Ford $30,616.00 ($6,800.00) $23,816.00 $3,255.00 $746.00 $420.00 $28,237.00
SPEE;LCU;:IIT?:: I:!#710 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
Regular Cab UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $45,000 Total
Lebanon Ford $41,792.00 ($11,600.00) $30,192.00 $30,192.00 (incomplete bid)
Middletown Ford $57,880.00 ($8,000.00) $49,880.00 $49,880.00
Valley Ford Truck (State Coop.) $60,620.97 ($8,300.00) $52,320.97 $52,320.97
Walt Sweeney Ford $54,852.00 ($9,301.00) $45,551.00 $45,551.00

(w/ V-Box Salt Spreader

$30,934.23

)



2018 FLEET VEHICLES

Public Service Department

SPECIFICATION #711

TRADE-IN PRICE

%
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Crow Cab with B Cargo Box UNIT PRICE WITRADEIN
Budget: $40,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $33,620.20 ($3,000.00) $30,620.20 $30,620.20
Middletown Ford $30,896.00 ($4,000.00) $26,896.00 $26,896.00
Ricart Ford $31,914.00 ($3,000.00) $28,914.00 $28,914.00
Valley Ford Truck $33,984.92 ($8,000.00) $25,984.92 $25,984.92
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $32,338.11 ($5,500.00) $26,838.11 $26,838.11
Walt Sweeney Ford $31,696.00 ($4,700.00) $26,996.00 $26,996.00
SPECIFICATION #713 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
4x4 Pick-Up Truck UNIT PRICE NET PRICE Spray Bed Liner Air Compressor/
Super Cab (w/ partial rear doors) & Utility Body w/TRADE-IN Generator/
Budget: $40,000 Welder Total
Bob Ross Auto $38,752.51 ($4,000.00) $34,752.51 $420.00 $8,846.00 $44,018.51
Middletown Ford $38,107.00 ($4,000.00) $34,107.00 $600.00 $7,500.00 $42,207.00
Ricart Ford $43,843.00 ($5,000.00) $38,843.00 $500.00 No Bid $39,343.00
Valley Ford Truck $43,764.84 ($5,500.00) $38,264.84 $599.00 $6,900.00 $45,763.84
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $40,781.68 ($7,000.00) $33,781.68 No Bid No Bid $33,781.68
Walt Sweeney Ford (State Coop.) $36,515.00 ($7,000.00) $29,515.00 $425.00 $8,850.00 $38,790.00
SPES:I;IiS:J;?rNucTIQZ UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE ALI“IEVIEQPTCTE AL'I;IEDIIQ::;ATE A;EES?::IE
Regular Cab w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $35,000
Bob Ross Auto $34,257.87 ($5,000.00) $29,257.87 $3,255.00 $740.00 $420.00
Middletown Ford $31,478.00 ($6,000.00) $25,478.00 $4,000.00 $800.00 $600.00
Ricart Ford $30,182.00 ($5,000.00) $25,182.00 $5,695.00 $840.00 $450.00
Valley Ford Truck $31,976.84 ($7,500.00) $24,476.84 $3,995.00 $1,011.00 $496.00
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $31,814.73 ($7,900.00) $23,914.73 $3,100.00 $711.00 $463.50
Walt Sweeney Ford $30,616.00 ($3,500.00) $27,116.00 $3,255.00 $746.00 $420.00
SPES(:;I::IE:TION #801 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
4-D’c)::1>‘|:'t = UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $25,000 Total
Valley Ford Truck $20,245.46 ($6,000.00) $14,245.46 $14,245.46
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $23,830.00 ($5,200.00) $18,630.00 $18,630.00
Walt Sweeney Ford (State Coop.) $20,055.00 ($5,300.00) $14,755.00 $14,755.00

(incomplete bid)

(incomplete bid)

Total

$33,672.87
$30,878.00
$32,167.00
$29,978.84
$28,189.23
$31,537.00

(w/ V-Box Salt Spreader

$32,534.23

)
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SPE“S‘:I;IiS:J;?rNuiMO UNIT PRICE TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE ALIE?PTCTE AL'I;EOIIQBI‘:;ATE A;EVE:(:‘IL»:IE
Regular Cab w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $35,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $34,257.87 ($4,500.00) $29,757.87 $3,255.00 $740.00 $420.00 $34,172.87
Middletown Ford $31,478.00 ($5,000.00) $26,478.00 $4,000.00 $800.00 $600.00 $31,878.00
Ricart Ford $30,182.00 $0.00 $30,182.00 $5,695.00 $840.00 $450.00 $37,167.00
Valley Ford Truck $31,976.84 ($7,000.00) $24,976.84 $3,997.00 $1,011.00 $496.00 $30,480.84
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram (State Coop.) $31,814.73 ($8,000.00) $23,814.73 $3,100.00 $711.00 $463.50 $28,089.23
Walt Sweeney Ford $30,616.00 ($4,900.00) $25,716.00 $3,255.00 $746.00 $420.00 $30,137.00
SPECIFICATION #U111 TRADE-IN PRICE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
4x4 Pick-Up Truck UNIT PRICE NET PRICE Snow Plow Running Boards Spray Bed Liner
Super Cab (w/ partial rear doors) w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $50,000 Total
Bob Ross Auto $30,419.91 ($5,000.00) $25,419.91 $3,255.00 $660.00 $420.00 $29,754.91
Middletown Ford $30,204.00 ($1,500.00) $28,704.00 $4,000.00 $800.00 $600.00 $34,104.00
Ricart Ford $29,927.00 ($3,500.00) $26,427.00 $5,695.00 $595.00 $450.00 $33,167.00
Valley Ford Truck $30,103.00 ($7,000.00) $23,103.00 $3,997.00 $1,080.00 $496.00 $28,676.00
Vision Chrysler Jeep Dodge Ram $30,414.35 ($5,000.00) $25,414.35 $3,100.00 $701.80 $463.50 $29,679.65
Walt Sweeney Ford (State Coop.) $28,916.00 ($5,500.00) $23,416.00 $3,255.00 $920.00 $420.00 $28,011.00
SPE('ilﬂgﬁlTsliCz):lsﬁsN1 11 TRADE-IN PRICE NET PRICE
4-I;oor UNIT PRICE w/TRADE-IN
Budget: $40,000
Ricart Ford $37,974.00 ($1,500.00) $36,474.00
Tim Lally Chevrolet (State Coop.) $36,431.30 ($4,000.00) $32,431.30
Valley Ford Truck $41,661.00 ($5,000.00) $36,661.00
Walt Sweeney Ford $38,865.00 ($4,500.00) $34,365.00




