CONTRACT MOWING SERVICES CITY OF WESTERVILLE

Parks & Recreation Department 21 S. State Street

Wednesday, October 19, 2016

% N

3:00 PM \’;l_(g I l“ 1{\, Il’ I }_, Westerville, OH 43081
BID SUMMARY
ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8 ITEM 9
COMPANY RIGHT of
WAYS RETENTION ELECTRIC FIRE WATER CITY IS
and BASINS CEMETERIES DIVISION DEPARTMENT | DEPARTMENT PARKS GROUNDS GROUNDS
MEDIANS
Klamfoth $47,200.00 $9,000.00 $43,400.00 $7,200.00 $3,600.00 $4,500.00 $57,000.00 $5,400.00 $700.00
BrightView Landscape Services $52,752.00 $10,173.00 $47,633.00 $8,188.00 $4,229.00 $4,976.00 $64,956.00 $4,061.00 $618.00
Hickman Lawn Care $60,466.00 | $12,294.00 | $49,122.00 $8,994.00 $4,697.00 $6,430.00 $85,300.00 $2,990.00 $1,640.00
Superior Outdoor Management $96,318.00 $25,957.00 $59,728.00 $10,264.00 $5,610.00 $8,956.00 $204,234.00 $3,281.00 $1,120.00
Autmow * incomplete no bid no bid incomplete incomplete no bid incomplete no bid no bid

Notes: * The bid submitted by Autmow, LLC. is incomplete and non-responsive as it includes only six of the 85 designated mowing areas and the automated mowing system being
propsed is not suited for the application of the City's mowing contract. The venodr representative for Autmow has been contacted by staff to coordinate a demonstration of their
automated mowing system and assess if the system fits any needs outside of the City's Comtract Mowing Services.
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