2016 WATER METERS

Water Division
Thursday, March 3, 2016

CITY OF WESTERVILLE

21 S. STATE STREET
3:00 PM WESTERVILLE, OH 43081
BID SUMMARY
ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8
5/8" x 3/4" 1" Water 1-1/2" Water 2" Water 3" Water 4" Water 6" Water High
Water Meters | Meters with Meters Meters with | Meters with | Meters with | Meters with Resolution
with 3/4" rubber gaskets| complete with | flanges, bolts, | flanges, bolts, | flanges, bolts, | flanges, bolts, | Encoders
rubber gaskets oval flanges, |nuts, washers, | nuts, washers, | nuts, washers, [ nuts, washers, | compatible
COMPANY bolts, nuts, gaskets, to gaskets, to gaskets, to gaskets, to | with Neptune
washers and | include either | include either | include either | include either | Meters for
gaskets strainer with | strainer with | strainer with | strainer with inside set
strainer kit or | strainer kit or | strainer kit or | strainer kit or
spacers spacers spacers spacers
Metron-Farnier No Bid No Bid No Bid $935.00 $1,575.00 | $2,075.00 | $3,075.00 $95.00
Neptune Equipment $84.50 $185.00 $478.00 $1,746.00 | $2,954.00 | $3,908.00 | $6,768.00 $71.00
Utility Technologies $99.80 $235.00 $495.00 $660.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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