
  

$19.96

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

2016 CREW        
HOUR PRICE                     

(includes (1) lift truck, 
(1) chipper, (1) 

Foreperson and (2) 
Journeypersons)

$127.14
$142.87
$148.00
$168.00

$35.00 $25.00 $23.00 $51.00 $49.00 $42.00
$68.19 $59.87 $58.21

$27.94 $15.64 $11.72 $76.45 $68.35
$38.25 $24.95

$17.10 $10.82 $6.44 $51.16 $49.12 $46.91

$32.00 $38.00 $33.00 $83.00 $83.00

$58.12

6.                              
TRIMMER B

$38.81 $31.04 $12.20 $38.81 $35.48

$35.00 $25.00 $23.00 $43.00 $41.00

$38.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$25.50 $16.63 $13.30 $45.46 $39.91

$34.74 No Bid No Bid $49.70 No Bid

$18.63 $10.43 $7.82 $50.97 $45.57

$10.82 $6.44 $37.90 $36.39

$34.00 $24.00 $22.00 $50.00
$36.96

$48.00 $41.00
$19.28 $65.88 $57.85 $56.24$24.10

$26.36 $14.76 $11.06 $72.13 $64.49

$32.00 $82.00 $82.00

$54.83
$16.93 $10.71 $6.38 $50.16 $48.16 $45.99

$11.78 $37.49 $34.28

$34.00 $24.00 $22.00 $42.00 $40.00 $31.00 $37.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$24.64 $16.07 $12.85 $43.92 $38.56 $37.49 $29.99

No Bid $49.21 No Bid

$17.57 $9.84 $7.37 $48.08 $42.99 $36.55 No Bid

$40.00

$10.71 $6.38 $37.15 $35.68 $34.06

$33.00

$10.61 $6.31

$23.29 $18.63
$13.92 $10.43

$23.00 $21.00

$24.86
$47.22 $45.08

$68.04 $60.84
$35.71 $63.65 $55.89 $54.34

$30.00 $36.00 $31.00 $81.00 $81.00

$16.77

$36.23 $28.98 $11.39 $36.23 $33.12

$33.00 $23.00 $21.00 $41.00 $39.00

$34.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.81 $15.53 $12.42 $42.44 $37.26

$33.39 No Bid No Bid $48.72 No Bid

$16.58 $9.28 $6.96 $45.36 $40.56

$22.00 $20.00 $48.00 $46.00 $39.00

$16.77 $10.61 $6.31 $36.42 $34.98

$49.26
$34.50 $22.50 $18.00 $61.50 $54.00 $52.50

$80.00

$16.60 $10.50 $6.25 $48.21 $46.29

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

6.                              
TRIMMER B

$32.00

$35.00 $32.00

$22.00 $20.00 $40.00 $38.00 $29.00 $35.00 $30.00 $80.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.00 $12.00 $41.00 $36.00 $35.00 $28.00 $11.00

No Bid $48.24

21 S. STATE STREET
WESTERVILLE, OHIO

$8.84 $6.62 $43.20 $38.63 $32.84 No Bid

CONTRACTUAL VEGETATION MANAGEMENT 
IN UTILITY EASEMENTS AND RIGHTS-OF-

WAY
Electric Division

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

10.                                          
TRACTOR WITH ARM 

MOWER

10.                                          
TRACTOR WITH ARM 

MOWER

10.                                          
TRACTOR WITH ARM 

MOWER

CITY OF WESTERVILLE

10.                                          
TRACTOR WITH ARM 

MOWER

No Bid

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

$34.29 $32.74 No Bid

2019                              
HOURLY                      

OVERTIME

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

2019                                          
HOURLY 

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

$17.10

Tuesday, October 20, 2015
3:00 PM

Lewis Tree Service $16.60

$15.79

$23.00

     BID SUMMARY

8.                              
BACKYARD CHIPPER

7.                              
BACKYARD AERIAL 

LIFT

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

2018                                           
HOURLY 

8.                              
BACKYARD CHIPPER

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

6.                              
TRIMMER B

7.                              
BACKYARD AERIAL 

LIFT

8.                              
BACKYARD CHIPPER

6.                              
TRIMMER B

$16.93

8.                              
BACKYARD CHIPPER

9.                            
SKID STEER MOWER

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

6.                              
TRIMMER B

6.                              
TRIMMER B

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

$44.20
$23.68 $13.26 $9.94 $64.80

9.                            
SKID STEER MOWER

9.                            
SKID STEER MOWER

6.                              
TRIMMER B

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

$57.94

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

7.                              
BACKYARD AERIAL 

LIFT

6.                              
TRIMMER B

$51.73

No Bid

2016                                            
HOURLY 

2016                                            
HOURLY                   

OVERTIME

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

7.                              
BACKYARD AERIAL 

LIFT

$10.50 $6.25 $35.71

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

$32.00

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

2017                                          
HOURLY 

2017                                        
HOURLY                      

OVERTIME

1.                                      
TRIM LIFT TRUCK 

w/CHIP BOX

2.                                                  
MANUAL CREW CHIP 

TRUCK

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

2018                                      
HOURLY                      

OVERTIME

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

3.                                         
SELF FEEDING 12" 
BRUSH CHIPPER

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

4.                                 
FOREPERSON / 

CLIMBING

5.                                
JOURNEYPERSON  / 

TRIMMER

$49.17

$49.00 $47.00

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

2017CREW        
HOUR PRICE                     

(includes (1) lift truck, 
(1) chipper, (1) 

Foreperson and (2) 
Journeypersons)

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

Pittman's Tree & Landscaping

Mercier's

Lewis Tree Service

American Municipal Power

2018 CREW        
HOUR PRICE                     

(includes (1) lift truck, 
(1) chipper, (1) 

Foreperson and (2) 
Journeypersons)

$129.46
$150.02
$153.19

$131.82
$159.00
$158.53
$178.00

$173.00

$168.56
$164.08
$183.00

2019 CREW        
HOUR PRICE                     

(includes (1) lift truck, 
(1) chipper, (1) 

Foreperson and (2) 
Journeypersons)

$134.22

9.                            
SKID STEER MOWER
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